
 
 

 

 
City Clerk’s Office 1 

 

Citywide Records Program 

Public Records Request #4519  
The following materials have been gathered in response to public records request #4519. These 
materials include: 

• ITB #269-2020-152: Fire Department Uniforms – Bid Tab 

This information was provided as a response to a public records request on 5/27/21 and is current to 
that date.  There is a possibility of more current information and/or documents related to the stated 
subject matter. 

Further Information 
For further information about this request or the Citywide Records Program, please contact:  

Cheyenne Flotree  
Citywide Records Program Manager  
City of Charlotte/City Clerk’s Office  
600 East 4th Street, 7th Floor  
Charlotte, NC 28202 
Cheyenne.Flotree@charlottenc.gov 
 
Amelia Knight 
Public Records Specialist 
City of Charlotte/City Clerk’s Office 
600 East 4th Street, 7th Floor  
Charlotte, NC 28202 
Amelia.Knight@charlottenc.gov 
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1 VizGuard Two-Tone 
Parka Spiewak S588VTR Each 100 NO BID NO BID Spiewak - 

S588VTR JX740 190.53$              19,053.00$        235.15$            23,515.00$          183.95$           18,395.00$          

2
Performance Soft Shell w/ 
Chest, Sleeve, & RFID 
Pockets 

Spiewak S318ZX Each 300 NO BID NO BID Spiewak - S318ZX JX873 115.50$              34,650.00$        135.35$            40,605.00$          105.98$           31,794.00$          

Blauer 6120 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 6120 112.18$           5,609.00$            
Fechheimer 59130WP 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 137.63$            6,881.50$           NO BID NO BID 

4 Dress Coat Fechheimer CFD 
Dresscoat Each 80 NO BID NO BID Fechheimer JX151 493.80$              39,504.00$        595.59$            47,647.20$          NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 6001 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 6001  $           130.29 6,514.50$            

Flying Cross 73160 50 NO BID NO BID Flying Cross - 
73160 JK542 135.00$              6,750.00$          142.69$            7,134.50$           Blauer 6001 NO BID NO BID 

6 Trench Coat Newport 261 - Darien Each 10 NO BID NO BID 261 - Newport JC353 195.40$              1,954.00$          227.94$            2,279.40$           261 - Darien 187.50$           1,875.00$            

7 Dress Pants Fechheimer 32288 Each 200 NO BID NO BID Fechheimer -
32288 TR618 95.70$                19,140.00$        94.03$              18,806.00$          NO BID NO BID 

8 BC Uniform Pants 5.11 74492 Each 150 5.11 74492 110.00$       16,500.00$        NO BID NO BID 84.93$              12,739.50$          NO BID NO BID 

9 Tactical Response Uniform 
Shirt Tru-Spec 1284 Each 50 Tru-Spec 1284 48.00$         2,400.00$         1284 - Tru-Sepc SH1062 39.50$                1,975.00$          49.40$              2,470.00$           Tru-Spec 1284 36.69$             1,834.50$            

10 Tactical Response Uniform 
Pants Tru-Spec 1285 Each 50 Tru-Spec 1285 48.00$         2,400.00$         1285 - Tru-spec TR425 39.50$                1,975.00$          47.13$              2,356.50$           Tru-Spec 1285 36.69$             1,834.50$            

Elbeco E2804R 3000 Elbeco E2804R 44.00$         132,000.00$      E2804R - Elbeco TR593 35.45$                106,350.00$      42.57$              127,710.00$        NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8821X 3000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 8821X 45.36$             136,080.00$        

Flying Cross FX57400 500 NO BID NO BID FX57400 -Flying 
Cross TJ262 34.90$                17,450.00$        52.65$              26,325.00$          NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8836 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Blauer 8836 39.21$             19,605.00$          

13 Uniform Pants, Men Flying Cross 47400 Each 500 NO BID NO BID 47400 -Flying 
Cross TR650 29.99$                14,995.00$        54.00$              27,000.00$          Flying Cross 47400 44.86$             22,430.00$          

5.11 74508 500 5.11 74508 60.00$         30,000.00$        NO BID NO BID 48.41$              24,205.00$          NO BID NO BID 
Blauer 8250 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 43.00$             21,500.00$          

Elbeco E2814LCD 200 Elbeco E2814LCD 44.00$         8,800.00$         E2814LCD - 
Elbeco TR590 35.45$                7,090.00$          42.57$              8,514.00$           NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8821WX 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.36$             9,072.00$            

16 Uniform Pants, Women Fechheimer 47400W Each 50 NO BID NO BID 47400W - Flying 
Cross TR651 29.99$                1,499.50$          54.00$              2,700.00$           44.86$             2,243.00$            

17 Uniform Pants, Women Blauer 8836W Each 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.21$             1,960.50$            
5.11 64435 50 5.11 64435 60.00$         3,000.00$         NO BID NO BID 48.41$              2,420.50$           NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8250W 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 43.00$             2,150.00$            
Elbeco E2824 300 Elbeco E2824 44.00$         13,200.00$        E2824 - Elbeco TR611 45.50$                13,650.00$        50.51$              15,153.00$          NO BID NO BID 

Flying Cross 47330 300 NO BID NO BID  47330 Flying 
Cross TU049 40.95$                12,285.00$        64.54$              19,362.00$          NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8841-1X 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51.16$             15,348.00$          

Elbeco E2834LC 300 NO BID NO BID E2834LC - Elbeco TR591 45.50$                13,650.00$        50.51$              15,153.00$          NO BID NO BID 

Flying Cross 47330W 300 NO BID NO BID 47330W - Flying 
Cross TU050 40.95$                12,285.00$        64.54$              19,362.00$          NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8841-1WX 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51.16$             15,348.00$          

21 Uniform Shorts, Men’s First Tactical 115002M Each 300 NO BID NO BID  115002M - First 
Tactical TR2259 37.15$                11,145.00$        42.00$              12,600.00$          35.61$             10,683.00$          

22 Uniform Shorts, Women’s First Tactical 125000W Each 300 NO BID NO BID  125000W - First 
Tactical TR2260 37.15$                11,145.00$        42.00$              12,600.00$          35.61$             10,683.00$          

23 Uniform Shorts 5.11 73342 Each 300 5.11 73342 35.00$         10,500.00$        NO BID NO BID 29.44$              8,832.00$           NO BID NO BID 

Blauer 8421 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Elbeco P867 75 Elbeco P867 35.00$         2,625.00$         P867 - Elbeco SH093 $25.25 1,893.75$          31.93$              2,394.75$           NO BID NO BID 

Flying Cross 85R5400 75 NO BID NO BID  85R5400 - Flying 
Cross SH020 21.96$                1,647.00$          36.29$              2,721.75$           30.17$             2,262.75$            

Blauer 8421 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P834 10 Elbeco P834 35.00$         350.00$            P834 - Elbeco  SH093 $25.25 252.50$             35.13$              351.30$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 85R5476 10 NO BID NO BID 85R5476 - Flying 
Cross SH020 21.96$                219.60$             36.29$              362.90$              30.17$             301.70$               

Blauer 8421W 10 Elbeco P811LC 33.00$         330.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P811LC 10 NO BID NO BID P811LC - Elbeco  SR751 $25.25 252.50$             31.93$              319.30$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 176R5400 10 NO BID NO BID  176R5400 - 
Flying Cross SH047 25.05$                250.50$             36.29$              362.90$              30.17$             301.70$               

Blauer 8421W 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P854LC 10 Elbeco P854LC 36.50$         365.00$             P854LC - Elbeco SR751 $25.25 252.50$             35.13$              351.30$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 176R5476 10 NO BID NO BID  176R5476 - 
Flying Cross SH047 25.05$                250.50$             36.29$              362.90$              30.17$             301.70$               

Blauer 8431 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P877 200 Elbeco P877 38.00$         7,600.00$          P877 - Elbeco SH095 $29.80 5,960.00$          36.13$              7,226.00$           NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 35W5400 200 NO BID NO BID 35W5400 - Flying 
Cross SH018 25.05$                5,010.00$          41.46$              8,292.00$           34.40$             6,880.00$            

Blauer 8431 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P824 10 Elbeco P824 43.00$         430.00$             P824 - Elbeco SH095 $29.80 298.00$             39.27$              392.70$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 35W5476 10 NO BID NO BID  35W5476 - Flying 
Cross SH018 25.05$                250.50$             41.46$              414.60$              34.40$             344.00$               

Blauer 8431W 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P801LC 10 Elbeco P801LC 38.00$         380.00$            P801LC - Elbeco SR750 $29.80 298.00$             36.13$              361.30$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 126R5400 10 NO BID NO BID  126R5400 - 
Flying Cross SH048 25.05$                250.50$             41.46$              414.60$              34.40$             344.00$               

Blauer 8431W 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco P844LC 10 Elbeco P844LC 35.00$         350.00$             P844LC - Elbeco SH750 $29.80 298.00$             39.27$              392.70$              NO BID NO BID

Flying Cross 126R5476 10 NO BID NO BID 126R5476 - Flying 
Cross SH048 25.05$                250.50$             41.46$              414.60$              34.40$             344.00$               

32 PAC Duty Shirt Vertx VTX8525 Each 300 NO BID NO BID VTX8525 - 
Vertex SR400 $74.00 22,200.00$        89.55$              26,865.00$          64.12$             19,236.00$          

33 PAC Duty Pants Vertx VTX8600 Each 300 NO BID NO BID VTX8600 -Vertex TR746 54.00$                16,200.00$        62.69$              18,807.00$          46.84$             14,052.00$          

34 Ties, Clip On -18" Samuel Broome 90010 Each 40 Samuel 
Broome 90010 4.65$          186.00$            90010 - Samuel 

Broome UA494 4.50$                  180.00$             4.46$                178.40$              3.87$               154.80$               

35 Ties, Clip On -20" Samuel Broome 90043 Each 75 Samuel 
Broome 90043 4.03$          302.25$            90043 - Samuel 

Broome UA494 4.50$                  337.50$             4.62$                346.50$              3.47$               260.25$               

36 Ties, Clip On -14.5" Samuel Broome 90051 Each 10 Samuel 
Broome 90051 4.65$          46.50$               90051 - Samuel 

Broome UA494 4.50$                  45.00$               4.46$                44.60$                3.33$               33.30$                 

37 Ties, Velcro -18" Samuel Broome 90111 Each 50 Samuel 
Broome 90111 6.95$          347.50$            90111 - Samuel 

Broome UA495 5.00$                  250.00$             6.92$                346.00$              5.27$               263.50$               

38 Ties, Velcro - 20" Samuel Broome 90129 Each 75 Samuel 
Broome 90129 6.55$          491.25$            90129 - Samuel 

Broome UA495 5.00$                  375.00$             7.08$                531.00$              5.40$               405.00$               

39 Ties, Velcro - 22" Samuel Broome 90133 Each 50 Samuel 
Broome 90133 6.95$          347.50$            90133 - Samuel 

Broome UA495 5.00$                  250.00$             7.69$                384.50$              5.93$               296.50$               

40 Ties, Hand Tie - 57" Samuel Broome 90072 Each 200 Samuel 
Broome 90072 6.25$          1,250.00$         90072 - Samuel 

Broome UA444 4.00$                  800.00$             4.38$                876.00$              3.80$               760.00$               

41 Dress Cap, Navy Hankin Police/Fire Each 75 NO BID NO BID  Hankin HA703 100.00$              7,500.00$          NO BID NO BID 114.67$           8,600.25$            
42 Dress Cap, White Hankin Police/Fire Each 8 NO BID NO BID Hankin HA702 105.00$              840.00$             NO BID NO BID 114.37$           914.96$               

Elbeco TEK3 450 Elbeco Cap 14 12.00$         5,400.00$         Tek3 - Elbeco HA037 9.75$                  4,387.50$          9.23$                4,153.50$           NO BID NO BID
Blauer 182-1 450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.72$             5,724.00$            

Nufit KC3000-
CFD 450 NO BID NO BID KC3000-CFD - 

KC Caps HA694 8.65$                  3,892.50$          NO BID NO BID 9.05$               4,072.50$            

Blauer 182 450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

45 Belt, 1.75" Garrison Gould & Goodrich B52 Each 250 Gould & 
Goodrich B52 48.00$         12,000.00$        B52 - Gould & 

Goodrich LP072 21.60$                5,400.00$          31.78$              7,945.00$           27.71$             6,927.50$            

46 Belt, 1.75" Patent Leather Dutyman 4631 Each 20 Dutyman 4631 38.00$         760.00$            4631 - Dutyman LR767 28.90$                578.00$             39.48$              789.60$              30.19$             603.80$               

47 Utility Belt Blackhawk 41CQ01BK Each 350 Blackhawk 41CQ01BK 46.00$         16,100.00$         41CQ01BK - 
Blackhawk TE041 26.50$                9,275.00$          36.05$              12,617.50$          35.07$             12,274.50$          

268,461.00$    436,690.35$     585,391.30$      420,617.71$       

5.11 72314 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 53.28$               $           1,065.60 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 20 NO BID NO BID 118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 $46.49  $            929.80 55.68$               $           1,113.60 47.58$              $              951.60 

Blauer 4630X 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 20 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $            963.80 55.93$               $           1,118.60 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 50 5.11 72314 59.00$          $         2,950.00 NO BID NO BID 53.28$               $           2,664.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 50 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $          2,324.50 55.68$               $           2,784.00 47.58$              $           2,379.00 

Blauer 4630X 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 50 NO BID NO BID  3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $          2,409.50 55.93$               $           2,796.50 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 250 5.11 72314 59.00$          $       14,750.00 NO BID NO BID 53.28$               $         13,320.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 250 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $        11,622.50 55.68$               $         13,920.00 47.58$              $          11,895.00 

Blauer 4630X 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 250 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $        12,047.50 55.93$               $         13,982.50 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 400 5.11 72314 59.00$          $       23,600.00 NO BID NO BID 53.28  $         21,312.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 400 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $        18,596.00 $55.68 $22,272.00 47.58$              $          19,032.00 

Blauer 4630X 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 400 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $        19,276.00 55.93$               $         22,372.00 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 400 5.11 72314 59.00$          $       23,600.00 NO BID NO BID 53.28$               $         21,312.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 400 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $        18,596.00 $55.68  $         22,272.00 47.58$              $          19,032.00 

Blauer 4630X 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 400 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $        19,276.00 55.93$               $         22,372.00 NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY TWO – JOB AND POLO SHIRTS

4 Tactical Job Shirt – Large 
(Navy) Each

5 Tactical Job Shirt - X- 
Large (Navy) Each

2 Tactical Job Shirt – Small 
(Navy) Each

3 Tactical Job Shirt – 
Medium (Navy) Each

 EXTENDED 
PRICE 

BIDDERS 
MFG 

NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

1 Tactical Job Shirt - X-
Small (Navy) Each

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

BIDDERS 
MFG 

NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
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UNIT PRICEEST. ANNUAL 
QTY
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44 Ball Cap, Fitted Each

TOTAL 

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

31 LS Shirts, Women (Dark 
Navy) Each

43 Ball Cap, Adjustable Each

29 LS Shirts, Men (Dark 
Navy) Each

30 LS Shirts, Women (White) Each

27 SS Shirts, Women (Dark 
Navy) Each

28 LS Shirts, Men (White) Each

25 SS Shirts, Men (Dark 
Navy) Each

26 SS Shirts, Women (White) Each

20 Uniform Shorts, Women’s Each

24 SS Shirts, Men (White) Each

18 Uniform Pants, Women Each

19 Uniform Shorts, Men’s Each

14 Uniform Pants, Men Each

15 Uniform Pants, Women Each

11 Uniform Pants, Men Each

12 Uniform Pants, Men Each

3 Waist Length Coat Each

5 Reversible Lightweight 
Jacket  Each

BIDS ARE DUE NO LATER THAN 2:00 P.M., OCTOBER 13, 2020

CATEGORY ONE – CLASS A, REGULAR UNIFORMS AND CLOTHING

ITB # 269-2020-152
Fire Department Uniforms Anderson Uniforms Galls, LLC Municipal Emergency Services, Inc Read's Uniforms 



5.11 72314 200 5.11 72314 59.00$          $       11,800.00 NO BID NO BID 53.28$               $         10,656.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 200 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $          9,298.00 55.68$               $         11,136.00 47.58$              $           9,516.00 

Blauer 4630X 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 200 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $          9,638.00 55.93$               $         11,186.00 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 50 5.11 72314 59.00$          $         2,950.00 NO BID  NO BID 59.95$               $           2,997.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 50 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $          2,324.50 61.35$               $           3,067.50 47.58$              $           2,379.00 

Blauer 4630X 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 50 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $          2,409.50 55.93$               $           2,796.50 NO BID NO BID
5.11 72314 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 63.55$               $              317.75 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 118507 5 NO BID NO BID  118507 - First 
Tactical SH3278 46.49$                 $            232.45 69.02$               $              345.10 52.88$              $              264.40 

Blauer 4630X 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elbeco 3730 5 NO BID NO BID 3730 - Elbeco ST493 48.19$                 $            240.95 55.93$               $              279.65 NO BID NO BID

9 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - X-Small (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2342 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

10 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - Small (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

11 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – Medium (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

12 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – Large  (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

13 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - X-Large  (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

14 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – 2X-Large (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 NO BID NO BID 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                 $            232.45 62.64$               $              313.20 47.58$              $              237.90 

5.11 41060 20 5.11 41060 37.50$          $            750.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $              800.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 20 NO BID NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $            677.60 41.54$               $              830.80 30.04$              $              600.80 

5.11 41060 100 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         3,750.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           4,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 100 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $          3,388.00 41.54$               $           4,154.00 30.04$              $           3,004.00 

5.11 41060 200 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         7,500.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           8,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 200 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $          6,776.00 41.54$               $           8,308.00 30.04$              $           6,008.00 

5.11 41060 200 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         7,500.00  $                   -   40.00$               $           8,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 200 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $          6,776.00 41.54$               $           8,308.00 30.04$              $           6,008.00 

5.11 41060 300 5.11 41060 37.50$          $       11,250.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $         12,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 300 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $        10,164.00 41.54$               $         12,462.00 30.04$              $           9,012.00 

5.11 41060 300 5.11 41060 37.50$          $       11,250.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $         12,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 300 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $        10,164.00 41.54$               $         12,462.00 30.04$              $           9,012.00 

5.11 41060 50 5.11 41060 41.00$          $         2,050.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           2,332.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 50 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 30.04$              $           1,502.00 

5.11 41060 5 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $              233.25 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 5 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $            169.40 41.54$               $              207.70 30.04$              $              150.20 

5.11 41060 5 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $              233.25 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112508 5 NO BID  NO BID 112508 - First 
Tactical SW2337 33.88$                 $            169.40 41.54$               $              207.70 30.04$              $              150.20 

5.11 41060 5 5.11 41060 37.50$          $            187.50 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $              200.00 NO BID NO BID
First Tactical 112509 5 NO BID  NO BID    SW2341 33.88$                 $            169.40 41.54$               $              207.70 32.43$              $              162.15 

5.11 41060 10 5.11 41060 37.50$          $            375.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $              400.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 10 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $            338.80 41.54$               $              415.40 32.43$              $              324.30 

5.11 41060 50 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         1,875.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           2,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 50 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 32.43$              $           1,621.50 

5.11 41060 100 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         3,750.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           4,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 100 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          3,388.00 41.54$               $           4,154.00 32.43$              $           3,243.00 

5.11 41060 100 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         3,750.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           4,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 100 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          3,388.00 41.54$               $           4,154.00 32.43$              $           3,243.00 

5.11 41060 50 5.11 41060 37.50$          $         1,875.00 NO BID  NO BID 40.00$               $           2,000.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 50 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 32.43$              $           1,621.50 

5.11 41060 20 5.11 41060 41.00$          $            820.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $              933.00 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 112509 20 NO BID  NO BID 122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $            677.60 41.54$               $              830.80 32.43$              $              648.60 

31 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
X Small 5.11 42056 Each 10 5.11 42056 43.50$          $            435.00  NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $              466.50 NO BID NO BID

32 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Small 5.11 42056 Each 30 5.11 42056 43.50$          $         1,305.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           1,399.50 NO BID NO BID

33 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Medium 5.11 42056 Each 40 5.11 42056 43.50$          $         1,740.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           1,866.00 NO BID NO BID

34 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 5.11 42056 43.50$          $         1,740.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           1,866.00 NO BID NO BID

35 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
X Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 5.11 42056 43.50$          $         1,740.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           1,866.00 NO BID NO BID

36 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
2X Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 5.11 42056 43.50$          $         1,740.00 NO BID  NO BID 46.65$               $           1,866.00 NO BID NO BID

37 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
3X Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 5.11 42056 47.50$          $         1,900.00 NO BID  NO BID 49.93$               $           1,997.20 NO BID NO BID

38 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
4X Large 5.11 42056 Each 5 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID 49.93$               $              249.65 NO BID NO BID

39 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
5X Large 5.11 42056 Each 5 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID 49.93$               $              249.65 NO BID NO BID

5.11 61173 50 5.11 61173 28.00$          $         1,400.00 NO BID  NO BID 23.49$               $           1,174.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 122508 50 NO BID  NO BID  122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 30.04$              $           1,502.00 

5.11 61173 50 5.11 61173 28.00$          $         1,400.00 NO BID  NO BID 23.49$               $           1,174.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 122508 50 NO BID  NO BID  122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 30.04$              $           1,502.00 

5.11 61173 50 5.11 61173 28.00$          $         1,400.00 NO BID  NO BID 23.49$               $           1,174.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical I 50 NO BID  NO BID  122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 30.04$              $           1,502.00 

5.11 61173 50 5.11 61173 28.00$          $         1,400.00 NO BID  NO BID 23.49$               $           1,174.50 NO BID NO BID

First Tactical 122508 50 NO BID  NO BID  122508 - First 
Tactical SW2341 33.88$                 $          1,694.00 41.54$               $           2,077.00 30.04$              $           1,502.00 

152,532.50$     $     189,683.90  $      378,235.60  $      119,195.65 

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST. ANNUAL 
QTY

BIDDERS 
MFG 
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BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER
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PRICE 

 EXTENDED 
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BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
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 UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

1 Poromeric Academy 
Chukka Thorogood 831-6032 Each 14 Thorogood 831-6032  $        65.00  $            910.00  831-6032 -

Thorogood FT1527  $                66.00  $            924.00  $             64.31  $              900.34  $             52.00  $              728.00 

2 Poromeric Cross-Trainer 
Plus Thorogood 831-6833 Each 2 Thorogood 831-6833  $      140.00  $            280.00  831-6833 - 

Thorogood ZJ404  $              128.00  $            256.00  $            147.62  $              295.24  $           119.37  $              238.74 

3 Leather Chukka Bates E00058 Each 61 Bates E00058  $      150.65  $         9,189.65 E00058 - Bates FW575  $              121.00  $          7,381.00  $            156.15  $           9,525.15  $           123.03  $           7,504.84 

4 Crosstrex Series-BBP 
Waterproof Oxford Thorogood 834-6293 Each 142 Thorogood 834-6293  $        66.00  $         9,372.00  834-6293 - 

Thorogood FT2378  $                65.00  $          9,230.00  $             73.08  $         10,377.36  $             59.09  $           8,390.78 

5 Crosstrex 5" (BBP 
Waterproof Mid Hiker) Thorogood 834-6294 Each 102 Thorogood 834-6294  $        73.00  $         7,446.00 834-6294 - 

Thorogood FT2379  $                67.20  $          6,854.40  $             77.46  $           7,900.92  $             62.64  $           6,389.28 

6 Black Eagle Athletic 2.1T 
Low A Haix Shoe 330016 Each 37 NO BID  NO BID 330016 - Haix FT1912  $              120.00  $          4,440.00 NO BID  NO BID  $           108.36  $           4,009.32 

7 GX-4 Gore-Tex Mid Cut 
Boot Bates E02266 Each 11 Bates E02266  $      130.00  $         1,430.00 E02266 - Bates SP757  $              125.75  $          1,383.25  $            124.62  $           1,370.82  $             98.79  $           1,086.69 

8 Maneuver Waterproof Mid 
6” Boot Bates E05506 Each 8 Bates E05506  $      134.00  $         1,072.00 E05506 - Bates FT2296  $              126.75  $          1,014.00  $            132.31  $           1,058.48  $           104.24  $              833.92 

9 DuraShocks Waterproof 
Boot Bates 3135 Each 66 Bates 3135  $      130.00  $         8,580.00 3135 - Bates SP707  $              119.00  $          7,854.00  $            139.23  $           9,189.18  $           109.70  $           7,240.20 

10 Maneuver Waterproof Side 
Zip 8” Boot Bates E05508 Each 8 Bates E05508  $      147.80  $         1,182.40  E05508 - Bates FT2297  $              147.75  $          1,182.00  $            150.77  $           1,206.16  $           118.79  $              950.32 

11 Patrol Boot WP Danner 25200 Each 3 NO BID  NO BID 25200 - Danner SP169 W - 
ZI198 M  $              269.00  $            807.00  $            312.31  $              936.93  $           246.06  $              738.18 

12 Men’s Striker  Bolt 6” 
GTX Boot Danner 26632 Each 3 NO BID  NO BID  26632 - Danner FT2099  $              179.00  $            537.00  $            190.77  $              572.31  $           150.30  $              450.90 

13 Lookout Station Boot 5.5" Danner 23820 Each 22 NO BID  NO BID  23820 - Danner FT046  $              123.00  $          2,706.00  $            123.08  $           2,707.76  $             96.97  $           2,133.34 

14 Duty Boots, 4.5", Women Danner 42970 Each 1 NO BID  NO BID 26631 - Danner SP169  $              150.00  $            150.00  $            164.62  $              164.62 Discontinued NO BID  NO BID 

15 Acadia Danner 21210 Each 6 NO BID  NO BID  21210 - Danner SP285  $              274.00  $          1,644.00  $            327.69  $           1,966.14  $           258.18  $           1,549.08 

16 Crosstrex 6" (Side Zip 
BBP Waterproof 6" Hiker) Thorogood 834-6295 Each 138 Thorogood 834-6295  $        80.00  $       11,040.00 834-6295  

Thorogood FT2380 -m  $                72.95  $        10,067.10  $             84.77  $         11,698.26  $             62.64  $           8,644.32 

17 Quick Release Station 
Boot Thorogood 834-6034 Each 157 Thorogood 834-6034  $        95.00  $       14,915.00  834-6034 - 

Thorogood FT520  $                85.00  $        13,345.00  $             87.69  $         13,767.33  $             72.73  $          11,418.61 

18 Deuce 6" Waterproof Side 
Zip Quarter Boot Thorogood 834-6218 Each 45 NO BID  NO BID 834-6218 -

Thorogood SP887  $                92.00  $          4,140.00  $             99.38  $           4,472.10  $             80.36  $           3,616.20 

19 5.11 Tactical 6" EVO 
Waterproof Boot 5.11 12313 Each 39 5.11 12313  $      138.00  $         5,382.00  12313 - 5.11 FT751  $              108.00  $          4,212.00  $            112.54  $           4,389.06 NO BID  NO BID 

20 5.11 A.T.A.C. 2.0 8” 
Storm SZ 5.11 12392 Each 32 5.11 12392  $      130.00  $         4,160.00  12392 - 5.11 FT1775  $              115.00  $          3,680.00  $            107.80  $           3,449.60 NO BID  NO BID 

21 5.11 Tactical 8" EVO Side 
Zip Waterproof Boots 5.11 12312 Each 107 5.11 12312  $      140.00  $       14,980.00 12312 - 5.11 FT749  $              108.00  $        11,556.00  $            118.46  $         12,675.22 NO BID  NO BID 

22 5.11 Speed 3.0 Waterproof 
Boots 5.11 12371 Each 16 5.11 12371  $      125.00  $         2,000.00  12371 - 5.11 FX689  $              108.00  $          1,728.00  $            100.69  $           1,611.04 NO BID  NO BID 

23 USAR Boots, 10" Matterhorn 12255 Each 6 NO BID  NO BID  12255 - Metguard FT726  $              270.60  $          1,623.60 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID 

24 Clash 6" Waterproof Boot - 
Men and Women's Blauer FW016WP Each 1 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID  $           108.46  $              108.46 

43
Women's Utility Short 
Sleeve Polo - X-Large 
(Heather Gray)

Each

TOTAL 

CATEGORY THREE – FOOTWEAR 

41
Women's Utility Short 
Sleeve Polo - Medium 
(Heather Gray)

Each

42
Women's Utility Short 
Sleeve Polo - Large 
(Heather Gray)

Each

30 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
3X Large (White) Each

40
Women's Utility Short 
Sleeve Polo - Small 
(Heather Gray)

Each

28 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
X Large (White) Each

29 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
2X Large (White) Each

26 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Medium (White) Each

27 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Large (White) Each

24 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
X Small (White) Each

25 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Small (White) Each

22 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
4X Large (Heather Gray) Each

23 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
5X Large (Heather Gray) Each

20 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
2X Large (Heather Gray) Each

21 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
3X Large (Heather Gray) Each

18 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Large (Heather Gray) Each

19 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
X Large (Heather Gray) Each

16 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Small (Heather Gray) Each

17 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Medium (Heather Gray) Each

8 Tactical Job Shirt - 4X 
Large (Navy) Each

15 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 
X Small (Heather Gray) Each

6 Tactical Job Shirt - 2X 
Large (Navy) Each

7 Tactical Job Shirt - 3X 
Large (Navy) Each



25 Blitz 8" Waterproof Boot Blauer FW028WP Each 1 NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID  $           135.04  $              135.04 

91,939.05$       $       96,714.35 $100,234.02 $66,166.22

512,932.55$    723,088.60$     $1,063,860.92 $605,979.58

1 N/A  $                8.00  $                23.33  No Bid  
2 N/A  $                8.00  $                23.33  No Bid  
3 N/A  $                8.00  $                23.33  No Bid  
4 N/A  $              10.00  $                  5.83  No Bid  
5 N/A  $              12.00  $                  0.83  No Bid  
6 N/A  $                2.50  $                  5.00  No Bid  
7 N/A  $                2.50  $                  5.00  No Bid  

1 N/C  $                5.00  $                  5.00  $                  8.00 

1  $              10.00  $              10.00  $                  8.33  $                12.00 
2  $                2.00  $                3.00  $                  9.17  $                  2.00 

Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons 
Add Maltese Gold Cross Application Add Maltese Gold Cross Application Add Maltese Gold Cross Application Add Maltese Gold Cross Application Add Maltese Gold Cross Application 

Patch Change Out Patch Change Out Patch Change Out Patch Change Out Patch Change Out 

Add Maltese Silver Cross Application Add Maltese Silver Cross Application Add Maltese Silver Cross Application Add Maltese Silver Cross Application Add Maltese Silver Cross Application 

Hemming / Alterations Hemming / Alterations Hemming / Alterations Hemming / Alterations Hemming / Alterations

PANTS

SHIRTS

Shirt Tapering Shirt Tapering Shirt Tapering Shirt Tapering Shirt Tapering 

Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid 
Change Braid Change Braid Change Braid Change Braid Change Braid 
Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid 

Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid 
Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid 

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TOTAL 

TOTAL AMOUNT 

CATEGORY  FOUR  – ALTERATIONS 

DRESS COATS  

   ITEM DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE



ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG NUMBER UNIT OF 
MEASURE 

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

  UNIT PRICE    EXTENDED PRICE  

4 Dress Coat Fechheimer CFD Dresscoat Each 80 Fechheimer JX151 493.80$                    39,504.00$                     

11 Uniform Pants, Men Elbeco E2804R Each 3000 E2804R - Elbeco TR593 35.45$                      106,350.00$                   

12 Uniform Pants, Men Flying Cross FX57400 Each 500 FX57400 -Flying 
Cross TJ262 34.90$                      17,450.00$                     

13 Uniform Pants, Men Flying Cross 47400 Each 500 47400 -Flying Cross TR650 29.99$                      14,995.00$                     

15 Uniform Pants, Women Elbeco E2814LCD Each 200 E2814LCD - Elbeco TR590 35.45$                      7,090.00$                       

16 Uniform Pants, Women Fechheimer 47400W Each 50 47400W - Flying 
Cross TR651 29.99$                      1,499.50$                       

19 Uniform Shorts, Men’s Flying Cross 47330 Each 300  47330 Flying Cross TU049 40.95$                      12,285.00$                     

20 Uniform Shorts, 
Women’s Flying Cross 47330W Each 300 47330W - Flying 

Cross TU050 40.95$                      12,285.00$                     

24 SS Shirts, Men (White) Flying Cross 85R5400 Each 75  85R5400 - Flying 
Cross SH020 21.96$                      1,647.00$                       

25 SS Shirts, Men (Dark 
Navy) Flying Cross 85R5476 Each 10 85R5476 - Flying 

Cross SH020 21.96$                      219.60$                          

26 SS Shirts, Women 
(White) Flying Cross 176R5400 Each 10  176R5400 - Flying 

Cross SH047 25.05$                      250.50$                          

27 SS Shirts, Women (Dark 
Navy) Flying Cross 176R5476 Each 10  176R5476 - Flying 

Cross SH047 25.05$                      250.50$                          

28 LS Shirts, Men (White) Flying Cross 35W5400 Each 200 35W5400 - Flying 
Cross SH018 25.05$                      5,010.00$                       

29 LS Shirts, Men (Dark 
Navy) Flying Cross 35W5476 Each 10  35W5476 - Flying 

Cross SH018 25.05$                      250.50$                          

30 LS Shirts, Women 
(White) Flying Cross 126R5400 Each 10  126R5400 - Flying 

Cross SH048 25.05$                      250.50$                          

31 LS Shirts, Women (Dark 
Navy) Flying Cross 126R5476 Each 10 126R5476 - Flying 

Cross SH048 25.05$                      250.50$                          

32 PAC Duty Shirt Vertx VTX8525 Each 300 VTX8525 - Vertex SR400 74.00$                      22,200.00$                     

33 PAC Duty Pants Vertx VTX8600 Each 300 VTX8600 -Vertex TR746 54.00$                      16,200.00$                     

41 Dress Cap, Navy Hankin Police/Fire Each 75  Hankin HA703 100.00$                    7,500.00$                       

42 Dress Cap, White Hankin Police/Fire Each 8 Hankin HA702 105.00$                    840.00$                          

44 Ball Cap, Fitted Nufit KC3000-CFD Each 450 KC3000-CFD - KC 
Caps HA694 8.65$                        3,892.50$                       

45 Belt, 1.75" Garrison Gould & Goodrich B52 Each 250 B52 - Gould & 
Goodrich LP072 21.60$                      5,400.00$                       

46 Belt, 1.75" Patent Leather Dutyman 4631 Each 20 4631 - Dutyman LR767 28.90$                      578.00$                          

47 Utility Belt Blackhawk 41CQ01BK Each 350  41CQ01BK - 
Blackhawk TE041 26.50$                      9,275.00$                       

285,473.10$                   

1 Tactical Job Shirt - X-
Small (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 20 118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 $46.49  $                          929.80 

2 Tactical Job Shirt – Small 
(Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 50  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                       2,324.50 

3 Tactical Job Shirt – 
Medium (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 250  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                     11,622.50 

4 Tactical Job Shirt – Large 
(Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 400  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                     18,596.00 

5 Tactical Job Shirt - X- 
Large (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 400  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                     18,596.00 

6 Tactical Job Shirt - 2X 
Large (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 200  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                       9,298.00 

7 Tactical Job Shirt - 3X 
Large (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 50  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                       2,324.50 

8 Tactical Job Shirt - 4X 
Large (Navy) First Tactical 118507 Each 5  118507 - First 

Tactical SH3278 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED PRICE 

CATEGORY TWO – JOB AND POLO SHIRTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG NUMBER UNIT OF 
MEASURE

CATEGORY ONE – CLASS A, REGULAR UNIFORMS AND CLOTHING

TOTAL 

EST. ANNUAL 
QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

ITB # 269-2020-152
Fire Department Uniforms Galls, LLC

BIDS ARE DUE NO LATER THAN 2:00 P.M., OCTOBER 13, 2020



9 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - X-Small (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2342 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

10 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - Small (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

11 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – Medium (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

12 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – Large  (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

13 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt - X-Large  (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

14 Women’s Tactical Job 
Shirt – 2X-Large (Navy) First Tactical 128507 Each 5 128507 - First 

Tactical SW2343 46.49$                       $                          232.45 

65,318.45$                     

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG NUMBER UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST. ANNUAL 
QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

 UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED PRICE 

23 USAR Boots, 10" Matterhorn 12255 Each 6  12255 - Metguard FT726  $                   270.60  $                       1,623.60 

1,623.60$                       

 $                       8.00 

 $                       8.00 

 $                       8.00 

 $                     10.00 

 $                     12.00 

 $                       2.50 

 $                       2.50 

 $                       5.00 

 $                     10.00 

 $                       3.00 

TOTAL 

TOTAL 

CATEGORY THREE – FOOTWEAR 

Shirt Tapering 

Patch Change Out 

CATEGORY  FOUR  – ALTERATIONS 

DRESS COATS  

SHIRTS

PANTS

Change Braid 

Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons (removal of all 
buttons and addition of new ones)

Add Maltese Gold Cross Application 

Add Maltese Silver Cross Application 

Hemming / Alterations

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid 

Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid 

Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid 



ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE 

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL 

QTY

BIDDERS 
MFG NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

  UNIT PRICE    EXTENDED 
PRICE  

7 Dress Pants Fechheimer 32288 Each 200 94.03$                   18,806.00$            

8 BC Uniform Pants 5.11 74492 Each 150 84.93$                   12,739.50$            

23 Uniform Shorts 5.11 73342 Each 300 29.44$                   8,832.00$              

43 Ball Cap, Adjustable Elbeco TEK3 Each 450 9.23$                     4,153.50$              

44,531.00$            

31 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - X 
Small 5.11 42056 Each 10 46.65$                    $                466.50 

32 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Small 5.11 42056 Each 30 46.65$                    $             1,399.50 

33 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Medium 5.11 42056 Each 40 46.65$                    $             1,866.00 

34 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 46.65$                    $             1,866.00 

35 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - X 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 46.65$                    $             1,866.00 

36 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 2X 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 46.65$                    $             1,866.00 

37 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 3X 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 40 49.93$                    $             1,997.20 

38 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 4X 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 5 49.93$                    $                249.65 

39 Polo Shirt - Long Sleeve - 5X 
Large 5.11 42056 Each 5 49.93$                    $                249.65 

40 Women's Utility Short Sleeve 
Polo - Small (Heather Gray) 5.11 61173 Each 50 23.49$                    $             1,174.50 

41 Women's Utility Short Sleeve 
Polo - Medium (Heather Gray) 5.11 61173 Each 50 23.49$                    $             1,174.50 

42 Women's Utility Short Sleeve 
Polo - Large (Heather Gray) 5.11 61173 Each 50 23.49$                    $             1,174.50 

43 Women's Utility Short Sleeve 
Polo - X-Large (Heather Gray) 5.11 61173 Each 50 23.49$                    $             1,174.50 

16,524.50$            

 $          23.33 

 $          23.33 

 $          23.33 

 $            5.83 

 $            0.83 

 $            5.00 

Change Braid 

Change Silver Buttons to Gold Buttons 

Add Maltese Gold Cross Application 

Add One (1) ½” Gold Braid 

BIDDERS 
MFG NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

TOTAL 

CATEGORY  FOUR  – ALTERATIONS 
DRESS COATS  

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

Add One (1)  ¼” Silver Braid 

Add One (1) ¼” Gold Braid 

CATEGORY ONE – CLASS A, REGULAR UNIFORMS AND CLOTHING

TOTAL 

CATEGORY TWO – JOB AND POLO SHIRTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST. 
ANNUAL 

QTY

ITB # 269-2020-152

Fire Department Uniforms Municipal Emergency Services, Inc

BIDS ARE DUE NO LATER THAN 2:00 P.M., OCTOBER 13, 2020



 $            5.00 

 $            5.00 

 $            8.33 

 $            9.17 

SHIRTS

Shirt Tapering 

Patch Change Out 

Add Maltese Silver Cross Application 

PANTS

Hemming / Alterations



ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE 

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

  UNIT PRICE    EXTENDED 
PRICE  

1 VizGuard Two-Tone Parka Spiewak S588VTR Each 100 183.95$                   18,395.00$             

2 Performance Soft Shell w/ 
Chest, Sleeve, & RFID Pockets Spiewak S318ZX Each 300 105.98$                   31,794.00$             

3 Waist Length Coat Blauer 6120 Each 50 Blauer 6120 112.18$                   5,609.00$               

4XL - $145.83
5XL/6XL - $196.31

5 Reversible Lightweight Jacket  Blauer 6001 Each 50 Blauer 6001  $                   130.29 6,514.50$               

4XL - $169.83 
5XL/6XL - $228.00

6 Trench Coat Newport 261 - Darien Each 10 261 - Darien 187.50$                   1,875.00$               

48-54 $206.25
56-60 $235.00

9 Tactical Response Uniform 
Shirt Tru-Spec 1284 Each 50 Tru-Spec 1284 36.69$                     1,834.50$               

10 Tactical Response Uniform 
Pants Tru-Spec 1285 Each 50 Tru-Spec 1285 36.69$                     1,834.50$               

14 Uniform Pants, Men Blauer 8250 500 43.00$                     21,500.00$             

17 Uniform Pants, Women Blauer 8836W Each 50 39.21$                     1,960.50$               

18 Uniform Pants, Women Blauer 8250W 50 43.00$                     2,150.00$               

21 Uniform Shorts, Men’s First Tactical 115002M Each 300 35.61$                     10,683.00$             

22 Uniform Shorts, Women’s First Tactical 125000W Each 300 35.61$                     10,683.00$             

34 Ties, Clip On -18" Samuel 
Broome 90010 Each 40 3.87$                       154.80$                  

35 Ties, Clip On -20" Samuel 
Broome 90043 Each 75 3.47$                       260.25$                  

36 Ties, Clip On -14.5" Samuel 
Broome 90051 Each 10 3.33$                       33.30$                    

37 Ties, Velcro -18" Samuel 
Broome 90111 Each 50 5.27$                       263.50$                  

38 Ties, Velcro - 20" Samuel 
Broome 90129 Each 75 5.40$                       405.00$                  

39 Ties, Velcro - 22" Samuel 
Broome 90133 Each 50 5.93$                       296.50$                  

40 Ties, Hand Tie - 57" Samuel 
Broome 90072 Each 200 3.80$                       760.00$                  

117,006.35$           

15 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - X 
Small (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 20 30.04$                      $                  600.80 

16 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Small (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 100 30.04$                      $               3,004.00 

17 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Medium (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 200 30.04$                      $               6,008.00 

18 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 200 30.04$                      $               6,008.00 

19 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - X 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 300 30.04$                      $               9,012.00 

20 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 2X 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 300 30.04$                      $               9,012.00 

21 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 3X 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 50 30.04$                      $               1,502.00 

22 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 4X 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 5 30.04$                      $                  150.20 

23 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 5X 
Large (Heather Gray) First Tactical 112508 5 30.04$                      $                  150.20 

24 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - X 
Small (White) First Tactical 112509 5 32.43$                      $                  162.15 

25 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Small (White) First Tactical 112509 10 32.43$                      $                  324.30 

CATEGORY ONE – CLASS A, REGULAR UNIFORMS AND CLOTHING

TOTAL 

CATEGORY TWO – JOB AND POLO SHIRTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST. ANNUAL 
QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 

UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

ITB # 269-2020-152
Fire Department Uniforms Read's Uniforms 

BIDS ARE DUE NO LATER THAN 2:00 P.M., OCTOBER 13, 2020



26 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Medium (White) First Tactical 112509 50 32.43$                      $               1,621.50 

27 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve – 
Large (White) First Tactical 112509 100 32.43$                      $               3,243.00 

28 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - X 
Large (White) First Tactical 112509 100 32.43$                      $               3,243.00 

29 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 2X 
Large (White) First Tactical 112509 50 32.43$                      $               1,621.50 

30 Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - 3X 
Large (White) First Tactical 112509 20 32.43$                      $                  648.60 

46,311.25$             

ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG NAME MFG 
NUMBER

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

EST. ANNUAL 
QTY

BIDDERS MFG 
NAME

BIDDER'S 
PRODUCT 
NUMBER

 UNIT PRICE  EXTENDED 
PRICE 

1 Poromeric Academy Chukka Thorogood 831-6032 Each 14  $                     52.00  $                  728.00 

2 Poromeric Cross-Trainer Plus Thorogood 831-6833 Each 2  $                   119.37  $                  238.74 

3 Leather Chukka Bates E00058 Each 61  $                   123.03  $               7,505.01 

4 Crosstrex Series-BBP 
Waterproof Oxford Thorogood 834-6293 Each 142  $                     59.09  $               8,390.78 

5 Crosstrex 5" (BBP Waterproof 
Mid Hiker) Thorogood 834-6294 Each 102  $                     62.64  $               6,389.28 

6 Black Eagle Athletic 2.1T Low 
A Haix Shoe 330016 Each 37  $                   108.36  $               4,009.32 

7 GX-4 Gore-Tex Mid Cut Boot Bates E02266 Each 11  $                     98.79  $               1,086.69 

8 Maneuver Waterproof Mid 6” 
Boot Bates E05506 Each 8  $                   104.24  $                  833.92 

9 DuraShocks Waterproof Boot Bates 3135 Each 66  $                   109.70  $               7,240.20 

10 Maneuver Waterproof Side Zip 
8” Boot Bates E05508 Each 8  $                   118.79  $                  950.32 

11 Patrol Boot WP Danner 25200 Each 3  $                   246.06  $                  738.18 

12 Men’s Striker  Bolt 6” GTX 
Boot Danner 26632 Each 3  $                   150.30  $                  450.90 

13 Lookout Station Boot 5.5" Danner 23820 Each 22  $                     96.97  $               2,133.34 

15 Acadia Danner 21210 Each 6  $                   258.18  $               1,549.08 

16 Crosstrex 6" (Side Zip BBP 
Waterproof 6" Hiker) Thorogood 834-6295 Each 138  $                     62.64  $               8,644.32 

17 Quick Release Station Boot Thorogood 834-6034 Each 157  $                     72.73  $             11,418.61 

24 Clash 6" Waterproof Boot - 
Men and Women's Blauer FW016WP Each 1  $                   108.46  $                  108.46 

25 Blitz 8" Waterproof Boot Blauer FW028WP Each 1  $                   135.04  $                  135.04 

$62,550.19

 $          8.00 

 $        12.00 
 $          2.00 

Hemming / Alterations
SHIRTS
Shirt Tapering 
Patch Change Out 

TOTAL 

CATEGORY  FOUR  – ALTERATIONS 

DESCRIPTION UNIT 
PRICE

PANTS

CATEGORY THREE – FOOTWEAR 

TOTAL 
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